


















From: julie young
To: Mike Burns
Cc: Erika Mooney
Subject: 118 Orange Street- Bike Path additional expenses
Date: Monday, December 12, 2016 2:35:12 PM
Attachments: bike path expenses.pages

Hello Mike and Erica, Thank you for putting our matter on the Dec 21 County Commissioners
 agenda. This letter
states our request. It there are any questions please contact either of us at email addresses
 above. Thank You.

Re: December 21, 2016 County Commissioners Hearing Agenda

                                                                                                                                                                                                        December
 12, 2016

Dear County Commissioners,

A portion of our land at 118 Orange Street was taken by eminent domain for purposes of building the Orange Street bike path. The
 eminent domain taking reimbursement has been made. However at the time of hearings about the taking we were given a plan for work
 to be completed by the town. We studied that plan as carefully as possible and worked out an agreement with the town to be reimbursed
 for expenses that were not reflected in the eminent domain reimbursement. The agreement anticipated two items not covered by the
 described work contract. At that time we listed cost of moving our interior rock wall to allow adequate turn around space in the parking
 lot, and cost of moving and reinstalling gas tanks, potentially having to bury gas tanks to adapt to a diminished side yard. An estimate of
 $5100 was approved by the County Commissioners.

The scope of work to be bid by the bike path contractor that impacts our property has always included the removal of two trees on Orange
 Street. Over Thanksgiving this year the largest of those trees blew over and had to be removed before it fell completely and did damage
 to our property and the property of our neighbor. We learned at that time, to our surprise, that town counsel considered the tree to be ours
 even though a bike path contractor’s bid including tree removal has been accepted by the town. We had to have the tree removed
 immediately at a cost to us of $3000. It is not our intent to argue about responsibility or incur legal fees, or to ask for more money. We
 would simply appreciate release of the originally agreed upon $5100 as the bike path work is to begin very soon and our additional
 expenses have already begun. We request that you authorize this amount payable to Brent Young and Julie Young individually in two
 equal amounts of $2550.

              Thank you,

  Brent Young
  Julie Young
  Co-owners, 118 Orange Street
  The Old Spouter

mailto:julie.young18@verizon.net
mailto:MBurns@nantucket-ma.gov
mailto:EMooney@nantucket-ma.gov
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Re: December 21, 2016 County Commissioners Hearing Agenda

December 12, 2016

Dear County Commissioners,

A portion of our land at 118 Orange Street was taken by eminent domain for purposes of
building the Orange Street bike path. The eminent domain taking reimbursement has been
made. However at the time of hearings about the taking we were given a plan for work to be
completed by the town. We studied that plan as carefuly as possible and worked out an
agreement with the town to be reimbursed for expenses that were not reflected in the.
eminent domain reimbursement. The agreement anticipated two items not covered by the
described work contract. At that time we listed cost of moving our interior rock wall to allow
‘adequate turn around space in the parking ot, and cost of moving and reinstalling gas tanks,
potentially having to bury gas tanks to adapt to a diminished side yard. An estimate of $5100
was approved by the County Commissioners.

‘The scope of work to be bid by the bike path contractor that impacts our property has always
included the removal of two trees on Orange Street. Over Thanksgiving this year the largest of
those trees blew over and had to be removed before it fell completely and did damage to our
property and the property of our neighbor. We learned at that time, to our surprise, that town
counsel considered the tree to be ours even though a bike path contractor’s bid including tree
removal has been accepted by the town. We had to have the tree removed immediately at a
cost to us of $3000. It is not our intent to argue about responsibility or incur legal fees, or to ask
for more money. We would simply appreciate release of the originally agreed upon $5100 as the
bike path work is to begin very soon and our additional expenses have already begun. We
request that you authorize this amount payable to Brent Young and Julie Young individually in
two equal amounts of $2550.

Thank you,

Brent Young
Julie Young

Co-owners, 118 Orange Street
The Old Spouter












From: Steven Cohen
To: Erika Mooney
Subject: 46 and 46A Surfside Road
Date: Wednesday, November 23, 2016 1:12:50 PM
Attachments: CountyCommissionersPlan.pdf

TransportationStudy.pdf
Special Permit - Recorded.pdf

Erika,
 
The property at 46 and 46A Surfside road was recently approve for an MDC permit that would allow
 a small restaurant with an apartment on a portion of the lot and a small office with an apartment on
 another portion of the lot.  As part of that permit, the Planning Board has requested that the owner
 try to obtain permission from the County to install a pull-off for parking and/or loading, as shown on
 the attached plan.  The pull-off is not required but would be beneficial to traffic and for local
 deliveries at this lot and otherwise.   This property abuts “The Muse” at 44 Surfside Road, which has
 paved a similar portion of the County Road Layout and uses it in a similar way.  Please find the MCD
 permit, the transportation study, and the final plan attached.
 
Please submit this to the County Commissioners for review.  Please let me know when it will be
 heard by the Traffic Safety Committee and by the County Commissioners.  I believe that the TSC
 already reviewed it for the MCD, and that changes were made to accommodate concerns raised by
 the DPW and NFD at that time. 
 
My client agrees to pay for any legal review by Town Counsel, if needed.
 
Please let me know if you have any questions or if there are any fees or notice requirements.
 
Best,
 
Steven
 
 
 
 
Steven L. Cohen, Partner
Cohen & Cohen Law PC
34 Main Street, 2nd Floor
Mail: Post Office Box 786
Nantucket, Massachusetts 02554
Tel. (508) 228-0337
Fax (508) 228-0970
Steven@Cohenlegal.net
http://cohenlegal.net
 
 

To avoid cyber-fraud and wire-fraud, please confirm all wiring instructions to our office via
 phone at (508) 228-0337, especially if you receive an e-mail or notice purporting to change wiring

mailto:steven@cohenlegal.net
mailto:EMooney@nantucket-ma.gov
mailto:Steven@Cohenlegal.net
http://cohenlegal.net/
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